
 

Neels en route to Europe to 
plan FCE Conference in Ger-
many, June 2022.  Pray for 
stamina to travel through 
Germany and Holland, good 
connections with FCE sup-
porters and ex-students.  
Anita is with their children in 
Namibia.   

 Jannie and Elise fly to Zam-
bia, to spend time with and 
support Elpela and Gateway.  
Pray for wisdom in guiding 
them to cross over into the 
new.  Praise the Lord for 
restoring Jannie’s health and 
for quality time spent with 
Pierre and Johan. 

Carel, Solem and Abigail 
finally arrived in Zimbabwe.  
Pray as they have to adjust.  
Trust the Lord for good rela-
tionships with the Christian 
communities, open doors for 
evangelism and to create 
opportunities to disciple.  
 

Bas Kruithof returns to Hol-
land after attending his 
cousin’s wedding in Malawi.  
Thank the Lord for those who 
lovingly host him in Africa.  
Pray that he will find a spir-
itual body where he can 
worship the Lord and also for 
a house to stay.    

Pray for Hester as she reach-
es out to the underprivileged 
families in the community at 
Wolseley.  She encourages 
the grandmothers who  take 
responsibility for the chil-
dren, because the parents 
are  neglecting their kids due 
to addiction and poverty. 

Thank the Lord for providing 
a house for Bart, Marthe and 
their kids in Holland.  Pray 
that their home will be a 
place of safety and a beacon 
of light in the vicinity.  Ask 
the Lord to make them part 
of a body of believers where 
they can serve Him. 

Praise the Lord that the 
Mackleys could submit and 
pay for Elizabeth’s Australian 
Spouse visa.  Also pray for 
Jordan’s temporary residence 
permit for South Africa that is 
in process since April.  Ask 
God  for a miracle to speed 
up the process. 

The  team in South Sudan 
and Uganda are working hard 
to establish sustainable vege-
table gardens in order to 
provide nutritional meals for 
the children.  Pray for their 
health and for the protection 
of the crops.  Thank God for 
financial support.   

Pray for the Malawi team as 
they faithfully disciple 
through the children, youth 
women,  men and the pas-
tors  ministries.  Ask God to 
open hearts and minds to the 
Biblical truths and the work-
ing of the Spirit. 

Pray for Jeanvion and the 
teachers of Gateway as they 
near the end of the year.  
Please stand with them in 
faith and trust for committed 
teachers for 2022. Pray for 
teachers with a heart for the 
underprivileged children 
from the communities. 

Pray for the children of the 
missionaries. Many times 
they find it hard to get to 
terms with their parents’ 
commitment. Pray as parents 
often have to answer chal-
lenging questions and have 
to guide them wisely into 
understanding.   

 

The team of Haggai Institute 
testify of change in the lives 
of the teachers from Eagles 
Nest and Rabonni who  were 
involved in the in-service 
discipleship training; Pray for 
change in their learners as  
they put in practise what 
they have learnt.  

Pray for the grade 7 class at  
Gateway, in Zambia who are 
writing their national exams.  
Pray for the teachers who 
have prepared them for this 
event, for the children to stay 
focused and for good results.   

  Pray for Ina who travelled 
from Namibia to South Afri-
ca, yesterday.  Praise the 
Lord  that she could bless the 
King’s Highway Rest Camp 
with her expertise. Pray for 
her health and a time to rest 
and for clear guidance for 
2022. 

 Boet and Celia, James and 
Lindie were in  South Africa 
to reconnect with family and 
friends.  Ask the Lord to 
renew their calling  and re-
kindle their passion to serve 
Him in obedience in their 
ministry in Zambia.   

Today we send out five par-
ticipants from the DMT in 
Wolseley.  Pray that they will 
walk confidently in Him to 
expand His Kingdom on 
earth. Praise the Lord for 
Carel, Sulene and the men-
tors who faithfully guid-
ed them in the Word. 

Ask the Lord for complete 
healing of Jordan’s ear. God 
provided and enabled Him to 
seek the help of an Otologist.  
Pray against permanent 
damage of the ear. Praise the 
Lord that we may know Him 
as, the One who HEALS.   

Piet needs to supply detailed 
information to the Zambian 
Higher Education Authority 
on all UFCE’s accredited 
programmes as well as stu-
dents that completed these 
programmes as from 1999. 
Pray for this process to 
be finalised in time. 

Pray for Eunice and the Els 
family in Zimbabwe  as they  
find their way to establish a 
network of believers, to 
serve in communities and to 
encourage the church to be 
the light. Ask the Lord to bind 
them together in unity 
and in love.  

Pray for Brian, Barbara, Mar-
riot and Martha, Moses and 
Regina in Gateway as they 
reconnect with Jannie and 
Elise.  Ask the Lord to protect 
them against malaria and to 
guide them in His wisdom 
and according to His 
plans.   

Many fishermen next to Lake 
Malawi are not saved. Their 
lives are ruined by alcohol 
abuse and immorality.  Pray 
for the Malawi team  who 
reach out to them.  Ask God 
to raise the men in that soci-
ety to become fishers of 
men.   

More than 150 South Suda-
nese children from the sur-
rounding villages rely on 
Amazing Grace Ministries for 
basic education.  Pray for 
Simon  who takes the lead 
and pray for more helpers to 
fulfil this big task.   

Thank the Lord for restoring 
Abel’s health.  Pray for him 
and Gloria as they demon-
strate a healthy marriage 
through their example and as 
they spend time to visit, to 
teach and to evangelise the 
people in the villages.   

Pray for Francois and An-
nalise who are in Namibia to  
receive the shipment  of 
computers from Steve, Aus-
tralia.  It was a long and tiring 
process, but we are grateful 
for Annalise who faced the 
red tapes and prepared 
the documents.   

Neels arrives in SA from 
Europe and Anita from  Na-
mibia.  Praise the Lord for 
keeping them safe, and 
healthy.  Pray for the Europe 
conference that Neels pro-
moted in Europe and trust 
for students to join the 
discipleship training.  
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