
 The team at Kalungu is expe-
riencing a severe outbreak of 
malaria.  Ask God to protect 
them against this serious 
disease.  Pray for those who 
are  presently on medication 
that makes them feel worse 
and pray for a full recovery 
in body, mind and  spirit. 

Pray for Jannie, Elise, Alburt, 
Esté, Sulene and Christine in 
Malawi. They are training 
young men who desire further 
discipleship training in order to 
be equipped to disciple the 
nations. Pray for courage to 
lay  down their lives in order to 

obey Christ’s calling. 

 Anita departs today from 
Namibia and Neels from 
Malawi en route to Cape 

Town.   

Thank the Lord  for  ministry 
opportunities and trust Him for 
fruit that will last.  Pray for 

safe travels . 

Ina is at present in Malawi to 
serve in the financial depart-
ment. Pray for her health and 
protection. Pray that she will be 
wise in training the staff with 
financial skills. THANK the Lord 
for the financial support to the 
ministry of the work in  Malawi 
through many years. 

Pray for Albert and Donna who 
are on vacation in South Africa 
after  a challenging time serv-
ing the Lord in difficult circum-
stances.  Thank God for the 
body of Christ who cares and 
supports them.  Pray for a time 
of restoration and connect-
ing  with loved ones. 

Carel Els has been invited to 
teach at a conference of a 
religious group in Zimbabwe.  
This is an opportunity to re-
veal the truth. Pray the Holy 
Spirit protects him and guides 
him in God’s wisdom and 
revelation.  Trust the Lord 

for breakthroughs! 

Francois and Annalize are 
soon to return from Namibia to 
South Africa.  Pray that they 
will finish the work that needs 
to be done.  Pray  for wisdom 
as they often need to give 
direction and Godly advice in 

planning situations.   

Daniel and Julia from Germa-
ny were not able to enter 
South Africa due to visa-
problems. In spite of many 
attempts the problem is still 
not solved.  PLEASE stand 
with us as we trust the Lord 

for a permanent solution.   

 

The King’s Highway Team at 
Okahandja creates an atmos-
phere for the Holy Spirit to 
work, through their faithful-
ness. Pray for Cecile and 
Sylvia in the office, Jesaja who 
builds relationships in the 
township and the workers 

who maintain a standard.   

Pray for Elma Britz who is 
undergoing a knee replace-
ment operation today in 
Bloemfontein.  Ask God to 
protect her during the opera-
tion and trust Him for a full 
recovery.  Pray for the medi-
cal staff who takes care 

of her.   

 Thank the Lord for Hester who 
is on her way from  Wolseley 
to nurse Elma Britz after her 
operation.  Pray for compas-
sion and wisdom to help Elma 
to a full recovery.  Pray that 
both may experience the 
Lord’s  presence in a 

special way.  

The Zimbabwe team rejoice in 
what the Lord is doing through 
them. Carel and Solem’s 
permits have only been ex-
tended for another year.  Soon 
they will have to reapply.  This 
is frustrating and costly.  Ask 
God for a strategy to 

solve this challenge.   

There are  many challenges in 
the dry season on the Isale 
farm. Pray against fires that 
destroy the fields and cause 
famine.  Pray for James whose 
desire is to manage the farm in 
such a way that it is an example 
to the farmers in the communi-
ties. 

 

Pray for guests at the King’s 
Highway rest camps in Malawi 
and at Kalungu.  Thank the 
Lord for the managers and 
workers at these campsites.  
Many campers testify that 
they experience something 
s p e c i a l  a t  o u r 

campsites.   

Eastern DRC remains a trou-
bled region.  Join Esperance, 
who was recently trained in 
Uganda, as she takes hands 
with fellow followers of Christ in 
her nation and pleads for God’s 
mercy and revival.  May many 
turn from their idols and 
serve the Living  God. 

Thank God for Sulene, Moses, 
Jannie and Elise who were 
involved in discipleship train-
ing in Uganda. The harvest is 
plenty and the labourers are 
few.  Pray God uses the young 
people who were trained to 
walk, serve and teach in 
His authority. 

The DMT advanced group that 
started their training in Malawi 
are on their way to Kalungu.  
Ask the Lord to continue with 
the good work in the lives of 
these students.  Pray against 
the enemy’s plans to steal 
what the Lord has re-

vealed to them.    

IMPORTANT ANNOUNCE-
MENT:  After nearly 31 years 
of trusting the Lord for our 
own piece of land and proper-
ty  in South Africa, from where 
we can work, train and sup-
port, the Lord has answered 
our prayers.  Celebrate 

with us in thanksgiving. 

Praise the Lord for the proper-
ty in Pringle Bay, Western 
Cape.  It is  zoned for training, 
seminars and tourism and in 

very good condition.   

Pray for the planning and 
logistics of the move in No-

vember 2022.   

 Pray for the body of Christ 
who is serving in countries 
where they cannot freely 
proclaim their faith.  Pray that 
they will be strong amidst 
persecution and hardship.  
Pray that they will continue to 
joyfully and boldly live 

for Christ. 

The Page family has indicated 
that the Lord has revealed to 
them to  return to Gateway to 
be involved in Education.  
Pray for them.  This is a diffi-
cult decision that will influence 
the whole family and also the  

ministry in Kalungu.   

 

Reinette and Bernice are 
often on the road driving to 
different schools to encourage 
and equip teachers.  Ask God 
for travel mercies and the 
finances needed.  Pray for 
teachable hearts and that 
teachers turn to Christ-

Centred Education.  

Pray for Etienne and the 
Elpela team who are organis-
ing the Nyika Cycle Tour in 
Malawi that starts today till the 
13th.  Pray for the physical 
strength of the participants.  
Pray for opportunities on the 
way to share the Good 

News and to glorify God.  

 

Ask God to prepare our hearts 
for the challenges that lies 
ahead as we move  to the 
new place.  There is not 
enough accommodation for 
the staff.  We will have to 
make some adjustments and 
need guidance in doing 

this. 

During the first half of this 
year we trained many disci-
ples.  Please pray for the 
protection of the seed that 
was sown.  Students struggle 
to adjust after they have com-
pleted the course and the 
enemy tends to steal and 

destroy.  BUT GOD. 
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